
 

 

 

Communication No: 079 

Funding Policy 2013/2014 for Short Track Speed Skating 
 
 
Olympic Winter Games Sochi 2014 Qualifying Events 
 
The following Samsung ISU Word Cup events have been designated as Olympic Winter 
Games (OWG) 2014 Qualifying Events:  
 

• ISU World Cup Short Track OWG 2014 Qualifying Event, Torino Italy 
• ISU World Cup Short Track OWG 2014 Qualifying Event, Moscow Russia 

 
SISA will provide support to the Overall Top ONE skater (either Men or Ladies) based on (1) 
overall available placement rankings and (2) timings achieved over all three distances in 
preceding 2012/13 and current 2013/14 seasons who has satisfied ISU Rules 108 and 109, to 
participate in the above OWG 2014 Qualifying Events. SISA will assist in the accommodation 
and travel arrangements with a minimum basic funding subsidy for airfare through SSC official 
appointed travel agent. 
 
Skater(s) in the national / national development team who satisfy ISU Rules 108 and 109 as 
well as meet the SISA Men and Ladies performance selection qualifying times for 500m of 
<55s and <60s respectively may be considered, subjected to the number of entries submitted 
for the competition per member country. The said skater(s) will be self-funded for the 
competition. 
 
Participation in the OWG 2014 Qualifying Events is subjected to the final approval, and at the 
discretion, of the National Team Coach and SISA Executive Committee. 
 
World Cup Competitions 
 
The following events have been designated as ISU World Cup Short Track competitions:  
 
• ISU World Cup Short Track, Shanghai China 
• ISU World Cup Short Track, Seoul Korea 
 
SISA will provide support to the Overall Top ONE skater (either Men or Ladies) based on (1) 
overall available placement rankings and (2) timings achieved over all three distances in 
preceding 2012/13 and current 2013/14 seasons who has satisfied ISU Rules 108 and 109, to 
participate in the above World Cup competitions. SISA will assist in the accommodation and 
travel arrangements with a minimum basic funding subsidy for airfare. 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 

 
 
Skater(s) in the national / national development team who satisfy ISU Rules 108 and 109 as 
well as meet the SISA Men and Ladies performance selection qualifying times for 500m of 
<55s and <60s respectively may be considered, subjected to the number of entries submitted 
for the competition per member country. The said skater(s) will be self-funded for the 
competition. 
 
Participation in the World Cup competitions is subjected to the final approval, and at the 
discretion, of the National Team Coach and SISA Executive Committee. 
 
World Junior Championships  
 
SISA will provide support to the Overall Top ONE skater (either Men or Ladies) based on (1) 
overall available placement rankings and (2) timings achieved over all three distances in 
preceding 2012/13 and current 2013/14 seasons who has satisfied ISU Rules 108 and 109. 
SISA will assist in the accommodation and travel arrangements with a minimum basic funding 
subsidy for airfare. 
 
Skater(s) in the national / national development team who satisfy ISU Rules 108 and 109 as 
well as meet the SISA Men and Ladies performance selection qualifying times for 500m of 
<60s and <70s respectively may be considered, subjected to the number of entries submitted 
for the competition per member country. The said skater(s) will be self-funded for the 
competition. 
 
Participation in the World Junior Championships is subjected to the final approval, and at the 
discretion, of the National Team Coach and SISA Executive Committee. 
 
 
 
Yours sincerely, 

 
Alison Chan 
Hon. Secretary 
Singapore Ice Skating Association 
 


